SUPPLEMENTAL AGREEMENT | DATE ST
GENERAL SERVICES ADMINISTRATION - - AVEVST

PUBLIC BUILDINGS SERVICE NO. 01 24,2011
SUPPLEMENTAL LEASE AGREEMENT )
TO LEASE NO,
E5-018-04621
ADDRESS OF PREMISES;
30-60 Quaker Lane, Warwick, R1 02886-0111 Building Number: RI 7085

THIS AGREEMENT, made and entered into this date by and between Baltic Quaker LLE

whose address is: /o The Baltic Group LLC; 2180 Mendon Road, Suite 11, Cumberland, RI 02864,
hereinafter called the Lessor,

and the UNITED STATES OF AMERICA, hereinafter called the Government:

WHEREAS, the parties hereto desire to amend the above Lease.

NOW THEREFCRE, these parties for the consideration hereinafter mentioned covenant and agree that the
said Lease is amended as follows:

1. Term: TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the said Premises with their appurtenances for a term of ten (10)
years commencing January 12, 2011 (the “Commencement Date™), and ending midnight, January 11,

2021, unless extended or sooner ternmnated as provided herein or as may be allowed at law or in equity
{the “Lease Term™).

2. Rent: To change the annual rent, effective January 12, 2011, by striking “$449,880.00” from Paragraph
4, Years 1 through 35 of the Lease, and substituting therefore “$326,685.107; and by striking
“$37,490.00” and substituting therefore “$27,223.76”. The calculation of such rent is set forth in
Exhibit A of this document.

3. Tenant Improvement Allowance: Paragraph 16 shall be amended by striking “$7.20” in the next to
the last line of the paragraph and inserting “$7.43” in its place. The Tenant Improvement Allowance of
$506,315.40, with a value of $7.43 per rentable square foot is not inciuded in the above-mentioned rent.

Upon completion of the tenant improvements referenced in paragraph 5, below, the anmmal rent shall be
adjusted via a Supplemental 1.ease Agreement.

continued on page 2)
ames as of the above date.

Managing Member

(fiele}

RVICES ADMINISTRATION

Contracting Officer

{Gfficial Title}

GSA DC 68-1176 (SPEEM computer zencrated form:JAN 92) (334 FORM 276 assiremaz



4. Broker Commission Credii: Péragraph 19 of the Lease is hereby deleted in its entirety, and the following
is substituted in its place:

“The Lessor and the Broker have agreed to a cooperating lease commission to ||| of the &
termn value of this lease consisting of the shell rate, parking rent, base year operating expenses and
arnortization of tenant improvement less the commission credit to the tenant. The firm term value of the
lease is five years multiplied by the total annual rental of or, Lessor shali pay
the Broker no additional commissions associated with this lease transaction. The total amount of the
commission i I accordance with the “Broker Commission and Commission Credit”
paragraph, the Broker has agreed to forego ||| N G @) of thc commission that it is entitied
to receive in connection with this lease transaction (“Commission Credit”). The Commission Credit is
B o shall be paid in one monthly payments ||| jJJJJJE- The Lessor agrees to pay
Commission less the Commission Credit to the Broker in accordance with the “Broker Commission and
Commission Credit paragraph in the SFO attached to and forming a part of this lease.

Notwithstanding Paragraph 4 of this Standard Form 2, the shell rental paymenis due and owing under this
lease shall be reduced to fully recapture this commission credit. The reduction in shell rent shall
commence and be completed with the {irst month of the rental payments as indicated in the following
schedule for adjusted Monthly Rent:

First month’s rental payment is $27,223.76. The monthly shell rent is $19,001.35, The rental payment
minus the commission Credit o cqva!s [ ~aich shall be the adjusted first month’s

rent.

5. Alterations. The Government anticipates that it shall require paint, carpet and alterations io the
demised premises. Lessor shall provide ali the labor, services, materials and permits to paint, carpet, and
alter the demised premises. The Lessor shall contribute 10% of the total cost for only the carpet and paint,
and the Government shall pay 90% of the total cost of the cost of paint and carpet and 100% of all other
work. The paint, carpet, alterations and 2l other work that is to be amortized by the Lessor shall be
completed within one year of the Government’s execution of this document. A Notice to Proceed shall be
issued by the Government prior io Lessor commencing work.

All other terrns and conditions of the Lease shall remain in full force and effect.

(end of 2™ page) i\\

%

Y ' ;o
Tnitials: %g i & glM'L(
Ligssor ov’E






Accessibility Report





		Filename: 

		LRI04621-SLA-1-_R.pdf









		Report created by: 

		



		Organization: 

		LMI







 [Personal and organization information from the Preferences > Identity dialog.]



Summary



The checker found no problems in this document.





		Needs manual check: 0



		Passed manually: 0



		Failed manually: 0



		Skipped: 20



		Passed: 12



		Failed: 0







Detailed Report





		Document





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Accessibility permission flag		Skipped		Accessibility permission flag must be set



		Image-only PDF		Skipped		Document is not image-only PDF



		Tagged PDF		Skipped		Document is tagged PDF



		Logical Reading Order		Skipped		Document structure provides a logical reading order



		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified



		Title		Skipped		Document title is showing in title bar



		Bookmarks		Skipped		Bookmarks are present in large documents



		Color contrast		Skipped		Document has appropriate color contrast



		Page Content





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged



		Tagged annotations		Skipped		All annotations are tagged



		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order



		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided



		Tagged multimedia		Skipped		All multimedia objects are tagged



		Screen flicker		Skipped		Page will not cause screen flicker



		Scripts		Skipped		No inaccessible scripts



		Timed responses		Skipped		Page does not require timed responses



		Navigation links		Skipped		Navigation links are not repetitive



		Forms





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged form fields		Skipped		All form fields are tagged



		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description



		Alternate Text





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text



		Nested alternate text		Skipped		Alternate text that will never be read



		Associated with content		Skipped		Alternate text must be associated with some content



		Hides annotation		Skipped		Alternate text should not hide annotation



		Other elements alternate text		Skipped		Other elements that require alternate text



		Tables





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot



		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR



		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers



		Regularity		Passed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column



		Summary		Skipped		Tables must have a summary



		Lists





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L



		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI



		Headings





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Appropriate nesting		Skipped		Appropriate nesting










Back to Top



